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Time allowed: 3 hours 

Q.1 

i) 

Prince Ltd. desires to appoint an additional director on its Board of directors. The Articles 
of the company confer upon the Board to exercise the power to appoint such a director. As 
such Mis appointed as an additional director. In the light of the provisions of the Companies 
Act, 2013, examine: 

ii) 

Ya6 1 

Note: All questions are compulsory 
Max.Marks : 100 

Q.2 

Whether M can continue as director if the annual general meeting of the 
company is not held within the stipulated period and is adjourned to a later 
date? 

(i) 

(5) 
Can the power of appointing additional director be exercised by the Annual 
General Meeting? 

i) ¥t qta sfedaca fsyast aast Hs H IfcaI(Annual General Meeting) 

(5) 
As the Company Secretary of the company what checks would you make after M 
is appointed as an additional director? 

t4(Articles of Association) Èd3 G MfHÜ Tfrdace t fsuast ads Hast é Ga �Go 

(10) 

(5) 

(5) 

(10) 

State with reference to the relevant provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 whether the 
following persons can be appointed as a Director of a company: 

Mr. A, who has huge personal liabilities far in excess of his Assets and Properties, 
has applied to the court for adjudicating him as an insolvent and such application 
is pending. 

(Revenue Accounts & Companies Act) 



(ii) 

(iii) 

Q.3 

(iv) 

YH6 2 

ttrtdaed foyag ag Hae : 

Mr. B, who was caught red-handed in a shop lifting case two years ago, was 
convicted by a court and sentenced to imprisonment for a period of eight weeks. 

Mr. C, a Former Bank Executive, was convicted by a court eight years ago tor 
embezzlement of funds and sentenced to imprisonment for a period of one year. 
Mr. D is a Director of DLT Limited, which has not filed its Annual Returns 
pertaining to the Annual General Meetings held in the years 2011, 2012 and 
2013. 

(iv) Mr D DLT Limited fea sfeaes , frH T3 2011, 2012 3 2013 fëe dïnt HIG 

(4 X 5=20) 

(ii) 

DD Ltd. is a listed company and it has been served with notice for appointment of small 
shareholders' director. Referring to the provisions of the Companies Act, 2013, advise on 
the following: 

(ii) 

(4X 5=20) 

(i) Define the term 'small shareholder' and specify the number of smal 
shareholders who may serve notice on the company for a director representing 
them. (6) 
Is it possible to appoint a person who does not hold any share in the company, 
as small shareholders' director ? (6) 
What is the tenure of small shareholders' director and whether he can be 
reappointed as such, after expiry of his tenure? Also state whether he can be 
appointed as an officer of the company on expiry of his tenure as small 
shareholders' director. (8 



YHS 3 

Q.4 

(i) 

(ii) 

A and B were appointed as first directors on 4th April, 2014 in Sun Glass Ltd. Thereafter, C, 

D International Technologies Limited, a listed company, being managed by a Managing 
Director proposes to pay the following managerial remuneration: 

(ii) 

(6) 

(6) 

H6 4 

(8) 

Commission at the rate of five percent of the net profits to its Managing Director, 

Mr. Kamal. 

The directors other than the Managing Director are proposed to be paid monthly 
remuneration of 50,000 and also commission at the rate of one percent of net 

profits of the company subject to the condition that overall remuneration 
payable to ordinary directors including monthly remuneration payable to each 
of them shall not exceed two percent of the net profits of the company. The 

commission is to be distributed equally among all the directors. 
The company also proposes to pay suitable additional remuneration to Mr. 

Bhat, a director, for professional services rendered as software engineer, 
whenever such services are utilized. 

You are regquired to examine with reference to the provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 
the validity of the above proposals. (6+8+6) 

A n3 B Sun Glass Ltd fee 4 nrs, 2014 ufus fodeHa À foya3 A3 fr ti fer 3 
E, C, D International Technologies Limited, fea fyH�3 UI, A fa fea tofiaI zaca 



Q.5 

(6+8+6) 

What do you understand by the term "Director ldentification Number" (DIN)? Describe the 
procedure to obtain the same as enumerated under the Companies Act, 2013 read with the relevant Rules. 

(5+15) 

Jt "Director ldentification Number" (DIN) EHE Ear ¥t HHSà Áfg foi ng dut 

(5+15) 



(5) 

(5) 

ngfa BHOB Bedacd Not ac, 2013 t 96 3fJ3 HYS HOJH 

ANSWER KEY(PUNJABI) 

(i) 

(1) 

GUoH Nde, 2013 yg 161(1) feg yers ad fa fat t 

Paper- Il (Revenue Accounts & Companies Act) 

(0) 
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Q2 

(0) 

(iü) 

(i) 

(iv) 

taHo 164 (1) (c) afde dfa àâ fenas fat austdacJ À fOyes gé tai 

(10) 

(i) ya 164 (1) (3) afd tfa aé fenast fa �Ñt t edacg fsuast g 

AaHS 164 (2) afder d fa a feas fat aust 3teacd à fda à. fHÜ 

(4 X 5=20) 



Q3 

(iü) 

(ii) 

(a) fga JH Jda; H 

(a) He 3tdacg sE ̀HJ; 

(6) 

(6) 

(8) 



(ü) 

(ii) 

197(1) 



(1) AaHS 197(4) NoHa, fat tfia à-HzdaA OHJ H3, fat 

(ü) Heaít n3 fMó3O ata e fo, tad duÑt yã 178 t g- (1) 

Companies (Appointment and Remuneration of Managerial personnel) Rules, 2014 nts foGyd3 

(6+8+6) 



L. Companies (Appointment & Qualification of Directors) Rules. 2014 Rule 9 sub rule 1 3id3 JJA 

Set �ed Hded G ga fas sa é|dr, As dr a Companies (Registration Offices and Fees) 

Rules, 2014 fe ` JI di. 

2. Companies (Appaintment & Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014 Rule 9 sub rule 2 3iB d 



Rrad; or 

duH nae, 2013 yJ 154 afa d HdG'd. a 153è3f f-sd yt3 

Companies (Appointment & Qualifications of Directors) Rules, 2014 Rule 10 (1) 31J3 VJC8 3 

(5+15) 
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Category- SAS(PART-1 EXAM) 

() 

Section 161(1) of the Companies Act, 2013 provides that the articles of association of a 

company may confer on its Board of Directors the power to appoint any person, other than a 

person who fails to get appointed as a director at the general meeting, as an additional 

director at any time and such director will hold office upto the date of the next annual general 
meeting or the l�st date on which such arnual general meeting should have been held, 

whichever is earlier. 

(i) 

(ii) 

Paper- I| (Revenue Accounts & Companies Act) 

ANSWER KEY 

M cannot continue as director till the adjourned annual general meeting, since he can 
hold the office of directorship only up to the date of the next annual general meeting 
or the last date on which the annual general meeting should have been held, 
whichever is earlier. Such an additional director shall vacate his office latest on the 

date on which the annual general meeting could have been held under Section 96 of 
the Companies Act, 2013. He cannot continue in the office on the ground that the 
meeting was not held or could not be called within the time prescribed. 
The power to appoint additional directors vests with the Board of Directors and not 

with the members of the company. The only condition is that the Board must be 

conferred such power by the articles of the company. 

a. He must have got the Directors ldentification Number (DIN); 

(5) 

As a Company Secretary, I would put the following checks in place in respect of M's 
appointment as an additional director: 

d. His appointment is made by the Board of Directors; 

2013. 

(5) 

b. He must furnish the DIN and a declaration that he is not disqualified to become a 
director under the Companies Act, 2013; 
c. He must have given his consent to act director and such consent has been filed 

e. His name is entered in the statutory records as required under the Companies Act, 
(10) 

with the Registrar within 30 days of his appointment; 



Q2 

The first3 cases stated in the question are based on the provisions of Section 164 (1) of the Com0anies 
Act, 2013 and the fourth case is dealt with in section 164 (2) of the said Act. Based on the provisions 
of the said sections, each case can be discussed as follows: 

() 

(ii) 

(i) 

(iv) 

Section 164 (1) (c) states that a person shall not be eligible for appointment as a director 
of a company if he has applied to be adjudicated as an insolvent and his application is 
pending. Therefore, in the present case, Mr. A cannot be appointed as a Director of a 
Company- whether public or private. 
Section 164 (1) (d) states that a person shall not be eligible for appointment as a director 
of a company if he has been convicted by a court for any offence involving moral turpitude 
or otherwise and sentenced in respect thereof to imprisonment for not less than six 

months, and a period of five vears has not elapsed from the date of expiry of the sentence. 
In the present case, although the sentence was only two years ago, but the period of 
sentence was only eight weeks, i.e., less than six months. Hence, Mr. B does not come 
under the purview of this disqualification and can be appointed as a director of a 
company. 

The third case also falls within the provisions of section 164 (1) (d). In this case the 
imprisonment was for a period of one year, i.e., for six or more months, but since more 
than five years have elapsed from the expiry of the sentence, Mr. C is no longer 
disqualified and can be appointed as a director of a company. 

Section 164 (2) states that a person who is or has been a director of a company which has 
not filed the financial statements or annual returns for any continuous period of three 

financial years, then such a person shall not be eligible either to be appointed as a director 
of other company or reappointed as a director in the same company. In the present case, 
DLT Limited has failed to file annual returns. Hence, the disqualification for Mr. D is 
attracted and he cannot be appointed as a director in other company nor can he be 
reappointed in the same company. (4 X 5=20) 

P 



Q3 

() 

(ü) 

(i) 

According to section 151 of the Companies Act, 2013, a listed company may have one 

director elected by small shareholders in such manner and on such terms and conditions 

as may be prescribed. 

Here, "Small Shareholders'" means a shareholder holding shares of nominal value of not 

more than 20,000 or such other sum as may be prescribed. 

A listed company may upon notice of not less than 

(a) one thousand small shareholders; or 

(b) one- tenth of the total number of such shareholders, 

whichever is lower, have a Small shareholders' director elected by the small shareholders. 

The small shareholders intending to propose a person as a candidate for the post of small 

shareholders' director shall leave a notice of their intention with the company at least 

fourteen days before the meeting under their signature specifying the name, address, 

shares held and folio number of the person whose name is being proposed for the post of 

director and of the small shareholders who are proposing such person for the office of 

director. 

However, if the person being proposed does not hold any shares in the company, the 

details of shares held and folio number need not be specified in the notice. 

(6) 

Further, the notice shall be accompanied by a statement signed by the person whose 

name is being proposed for the post of small shareholders' director stating 

(a) his Director ldentification Number; 

(b) that he is not disqualified to become a director under the Act; and 

(c) his consent to act as a director of the company (6) 

The tenure of small shareholders' director shall not exceed a period of 3 consecutive years 

and on the expiry of the tenure, such director shall not be eligible for re-appointment. A 

small shareholders' director shall not, for a period of 3 years from the date on which he 

ceases to hold office as a small shareholders' director in a company, be appointed in or 

(8 be associated with such company in any other capacity, either directly or indirectly. 



Q4 

International Technologies Limited, a listed company, being managed by a Managing Director 
proposes to pay the following managerial remuneration: 

(0) 

(i) 

(i) 

Commission at the rate of 5% of the net profits to its Managing Director, Mr. Kamal: Part 
() of the second proviso to section 197(1), provides that except with the approval of the 
company in general meeting, the remuneration payable to any one managing director; or 
whole time director or manager shall not exceed 5 % of the net profits of the company 
and if there is more than one such director then remuneration shall not exceed 10 % of 

the net profits to all such directors and manager taken together. 
In the present case, since the International Technologies Limited is being managed by a 
Managing Director, the commission at the rate of 5% of the net profit to Mr Kamal, the 
Managing Director is allowed and no approval of company in general meeting is required. 

The directors other than the Managing Director are proposed to be paid monthly 
remuneration of ' 50,000 and also commission at the rate of 1 % of net profits of the 
company subject to the condition that overall remuneration payable to ordinary directors 
including monthly remuneration payable to each of them shall not exceed 2 % of the net 
profits of the company: Part (ii) of the second proviso to section 197(1) provides that 
except with the approval of the company in generai meeting, the remuneration payable 
to directors who are neither managing directors nor whole time directors shall not 
exceed 

(A) 1% of the net profits of the company, if there is a managing or whole time director or 
manager; 
(B) 3% of the net profits in any other case. 
In the present case, the maximum remuneration allowed for directors other than 

managing or whole time director is 1% of the net profits of the company because the 
company is having a managing director also. Hence, if the company wants to fix their 
remuneration at not more than 2% of the net profits of the company, the approval of the 

company in general meeting is required. 
The company also proposes to pay suitable additional remuneration to Mr. Bhatt, a 
director, for professional services rendered as software engineer, whenever such services 
are utilized: 

(1) According to section 197(4), the remuneration payable to the directors of a company, 
including any managing or whole-time director or manager, shall be determined, in 
accordance with and subject to the provisions of this section, either 
(i) by the articles of the company, or 

(ii) by a resolution or, 
(ii) if the articles so require, by a special resolution, passed by the company in general 
meeting, and 

(2) the remuneration payable to a director determined aforesaid shall be inclusive of the 
remuneration payabie to him for the services rendered by him in any other capacity. 
(3) Any remuneration for services rendered by any such director in other capacity shall 
not be so included if 

(i) the services rendered are of a professional nature; and 



Director ldentification Number (DIN) is a Unique ldentification Number issued by the Ministry of 
Corporate Affairs. It is required to be obtained by every person who is intending to become a director 
of any company. DIN is a pre-requisite for filing various forms with the Registrar of Companies. The 
electronic system of the Ministry of Corporate Affairs will not allow filing / submitting of forms if DIN 

of the signatory director is not mentioned in the form being filed / submitted. 

Under section 153 of the Companies Act, 2013 every individual intending to be appointed as director 
of a company shall make an application for allotment of Director ldentification Number to the Central 
Government in such form and manner and along with such fees as may be prescribed. 

1. Under rule 9 sub rule 1 of the Companies (Appointment & Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014 
every individual, who is to be appointed as director of a company shall make an application 
electronically in Form DIR-3, to the Central Government for the allotment of a Director ldentification 
Number (DIN) along with such fees as provided in the Companies (Registration Offices and Fees) Rules, 
2014. 

2. Under rule 9 (2) of the said rules The Central Government shall provide an electronic system to 
facilitate submission of application for the allotment of DIN through the portal on the website of the 
Ministry of Corporate Affairs. 

3. The applicant shall download Form DIR-3 from the portal, fill in the reguired particulars sought 
therein, verify and sign the form and after attaching copies of the following documents, scan and file 
the entire set of documents electronically 

(i) 
(ü) 

(iv) 
(v) 

photograph; 
proof of identity; 
proof of residence; and 
specimen signature duly verified. 

4. Form DIR-3 shall be signed and submitted electronically by the applicant using his or her own Digital 
Signature Certificate and shall be verified digitally by 

(i) a chartered accountant in practice or a company secretary in practice or a cost accountant in 
practice; or 

(ii) a company secretary in full time employment of the company or by the managing director or 
director of the company in which the applicant is to be appointed as director. 

Section 154 of the Companies Act, 2013 states that the Central Government shall, within one month 
from the receipt of the application under section 153, allota Director ldentification Number to an 
applicant in such manner as may be prescribed. 



(ii) in the opinion of the Nomination and Remuneration Committee, if the company is 

covered under sub-section (1) of section 178, or the Board of Directors in other cases, the 

director possesses the requisite qualification for the practice of the profession. 

Hence, in the present case, the additional remuneration to Mr. Bhatt, a director for professional 

services rendered as software engineer will not be included in the maximum managerial remuneration 

and is allowed but opinion of Nomination and Remuneration Committee is to be obtained. 

Also, the International Technologies Limited,.(a listed company) shall disclose in the Board's report, 
the ratio of the remuneration of each director to the median employee's remuneration and such other 

details as may be prescribed under the Companies (Appointment and Remuneration of Managerial 

personnel) Rules, 2014. 

(6+8+6) 



Rule 10 (1) of the Companies (Appointment & Qualifications of Directors) Rules, 2014 states that on 

the submission of the Form DIR-3 on the portal and pavment of the requisite amount of fees through 

online mode, an application number shall be generated by the system automatically 

Rule 10 (2) further provides that after generation of application number, the Central Government shall 

process the applications received for allotment of DIN and decide on the approval or rejection thereof 

and communicate the same to the applicant along with the DIN allotted in case of approval by way of 

a letter by post or electronically or in any other mode, within a period of one month from the receipt 

of such application. 
(5+15) 
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